
Witnesses

Name Agency

Jason Poscovsky City of Sugar Land

Todd Reed City of Sugar Land

Bids Received

Sugar Land Calendar

Bidding Agency Date/Time Received FSC Certified 
Non - FSC 

Certified
FSC Certified 

Non - FSC 

Certified

Southwest Precision Printers 9/9/2010 @ 10:35 a.m. $25,760.00 $25,760.00 $23,350.00 $5,274.00 $5,080.00

Printing X-Press 8/26/2010 @ 11:35 a.m. $33,600.00 $33,600.00 $33,600.00 $3,990.00 $3,570.00

MultiAd 9/7/2010 @ 10:50 a.m. No Bid $38,960.00 $59,225.00 No Bid No Bid

Ket Moy Printing 9/8/2010 @ 9:45 a.m. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,600.00

DiscPro 9/7/2010 @ 9:57 a.m. $26,088.00 $25,224.00 $18,762.00 $4,993.00 $4,372.00

Palmer Printing Company 9/2/2010 @ 10:57 a.m. $39,600.00 $39,600.00 $40,930.00 $6,843.00 $6,843.00

Gulfstream 9/8/2010 @ 10:29 a.m. No Bid $24,560.00 $21,639.00 No Bid $4,230.00

Motheral Printing Company 9/8/2010 @ 10:45 a.m. $26,400.00 $30,000.00 $35,400.00 $6,570.00 $5,610.00

Motheral Printing Company 9/8/2010 @ 10:45 a.m. $33,720.00 $32,316.00 $29,861.00 $6,069.00 $5,266.80

Signature Media 9/9/2010 @ 7:32 a.m. $26,572.00 $26,572.00 $22,900.00 $6,540.00 $6,540.00

Pamela Printing 9/9/2010 @ 9:18 a.m. $35,484.00 $36,924.00 $20,447.00 $3,953.00 $3,716.00

Bayside Printing 9/8/2010 @ 4:18 p.m. $39,120.00 $38,880.00 $28,710.00 $6,540.00 $5,850.00

Specialty Bindery & Printing 9/9/2010 @ 10:00 a.m. $25,000.00 $23,680.00 $19,500.00 $4,665.00 $4,000.00

Kolor View Press 9/9/2010 @ 9:43 a.m. $34,608.80 No Bid $36,089.44 $5,506.60 No Bid

Richmond Printing 9/9/2010 @ 10:17 a.m. $30,748.00 $29,380.00 $21,765.00 $6,888.00 $6,795.00

Ginnys Printing 9/7/2010 @ 1:05 p.m. $24,868.16 $24,868.16 $22,466.62 $5,001.00 $4,521.00

City of Sugar Land Bid Opening

ITB 2010-41 Printing of City Publications

September 9, 2010; 11:00 am
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