



City of Sugar Land Bid Opening
ITB 2013-19 Purchase of Water Treatment Chemicals
May 30 , 2013; 11:00 am

Witnesses

Name	Agency	Signature
Jason Poscovsky	City of Sugar Land	
Todd Reed	City of Sugar Land	

Bids Received

Bidding Agency	Date/Time Received	EXTENDED PRICES									Addendum
		Chlorine Gas (100%)	Citric Acid (50%)	Hydrochloric Acid (15%)	Liquid Ammonium Sulfate	Sodium Bisulfide (39%)	Sodium Chlorite (25%)	Sodium Hydroxide (25%)	Sodium Hypochlorite (12.5%)	Zinc Orthophosphate (5:1 Ratio)	
BRENNTAG SOUTHWEST	5/30/2013 @ 10:28 a.m.	\$49,755.00	\$39,060.00	\$37,678.20	No Bid	\$2,674.35	\$87,997.00	\$66,495.00	\$99,220.00	No Bid	X
NAPCO CHEMICAL COMPANY	5/30/2013 @ 9:11 a.m.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.70 per gal (\$65,349.70)	797.50 per tote (\$3,987.50)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	X
SIEMENS INDUSTRY	5/29/2013 @ 10:31 a.m.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$63,072.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	X
NALCO COMPANY	5/29/2013 @ 10:00 a.m.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6,437.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	X
DXI INDUSTRIES	5/30/2013 @ 10:44 a.m.	\$36,915.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$85,910.00	No Bid	X
CHEMTREAT INC	5/30/2013 @ 10:48 a.m.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$181,800.00	X